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Group analysis developed out of psychoanalysis, but kept the fundamental principles of the latter. The
classical structural theory of the personality comprises the id that is an ego-centred instinct, the ego that
develops out of it, and the superego representing the influences of our guardians. It presents us with a lonely
person, not a very useful image for group analysis. The recently discovered social instinct enables us to
complete the structural theory, with an instinct based social function we call "nos", Latin for "we". The new
human paradigm gives us the social person. We are together, not because we have to be, but because we
basically like each other, various other feelings not withstanding. The "nos" provides us with the natural
milieu to relate, and opens the way for solving the deepest human problems.For a long time it seemed
unscientific to say that people were social, because the altruistic person dies out and does not have the
chance to propagate its kind. The selfish person is good at survival, therefore it seemed logical to say, that
selfishness was wining over altruism. Later on it became clear that we cannot understand people if we look at
one person alone. We live together. One person is no person. Animals also live in communities on their own
level. After that it was easy to discover the social instinct, and the values in it. The social instinct provides
scientific foundation to the theory of the social person.This book explores this theory in depth and includes
chapters on instinct and group analysis; the "nos" and the social unconscious; the phenomenology of the self
and Ferenczi's main principles
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From reader reviews:

Louise Reyes:

With other case, little people like to read book The Social Nature of Persons: One Person is No Person (The
New International Library of Group Analysis). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book.
Provided that we know about how is important a book The Social Nature of Persons: One Person is No
Person (The New International Library of Group Analysis). You can add know-how and of course you can
around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can learn everything! From your
country till foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you are able to
know that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book.
You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's learn.

Joshua Rodrigue:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will certainly
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you
is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Social Nature of Persons: One Person is No
Person (The New International Library of Group Analysis) is our recommendation to help you keep up with
the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Rosalie Castillo:

As we know that book is important thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This book The Social Nature of Persons: One Person is No Person (The New International
Library of Group Analysis) was filled regarding science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about
your research competence. Some people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know
how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to
get book that you wanted.

William Marsh:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
identified as of book The Social Nature of Persons: One Person is No Person (The New International Library
of Group Analysis). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it might
add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-
book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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