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The Singapore Perspectives series is a yearly publication that provides critical analysis of emerging trends
and issues Singapore faces in terms of social, economic and political development. It is a quick and essential
reference for understanding the broad policy discussions that animate thought leaders, policy-makers and the
public in the country during the immediate period or that are likely to do so in the short and medium term.

This edited volume brings together papers presented at the Singapore Perspectives 2012 Conference. The
Conference came in the wake of Singapore's General Elections held on May 7, 2011, whose outcome
resulted in Singapore's political leaders taking a fresh look at Singapore's public policy. More importantly,
the government has pledged to reconnect with all segments of society, as it grapples with the issues that have
arisen.

Some of the major issues discussed in the book include the widening income gap, the affordability of
housing and healthcare, as well as the re-examination of the processes of citizen participation in policy-
making. The book also includes the speech made by Mr Tharman Shanmugaratnam, Deputy Prime Minister
of Singapore, that outlines his views on the model of governance and policies that would help the country
bridge the divides.

Co-published by the think-tank, the Institute of Policy Studies, Singapore, this is a useful publication for
those with an interest in understanding the governance challenges facing a small, highly globalised economy
and nation-state, or those who want a quick feel of the pulse of Singapore.

About the Contributors

Contents:

Keynote Address:●

Building an Inclusive Society (Tharman Shanmugaratnam)❍

Business as Usual, No Longer?:●

Income Growth and Redistribution: Issues and Challenges (Paul Cheung)❍

Singapore's New Growth Model (Chua Hak Bin and Shawlin Chaw)❍

Macroeconomic Trends and Labour Welfare in Singapore: A Focus on Retirement Adequacy (Hui❍

Weng Tat)
Social Development and Working Together: Towards a New Social Compact:●

Re-Making Singapore Healthcare (Jeremy Lim and Daniel Lee)❍

Public Housing — Appreciating Assets? (Phang Sock Yong)❍

Retirement Adequacy and Housing Financing Through the CPF System (Chia Ngee Choon)❍

Politics: A New Paradigm?:●

Towards a More Equal, Self-Reliant Society (Ho Kwon Ping)❍

Information, Insulation and the Public Interest (Cherian George)❍

Model of Governance: Big Government or Big People? (Peter Ho)❍

Background Paper:●



Inequality and the Need for a New Social Compact (Manu Bhaskaran, Ho Seng Chee, Donald Low, Tan❍

Kim Song, Sudhir Vadaketh and Yeoh Lam Keong)

Readership: Students, academics, policy makers and civil society activists, and general public interested in
Singapore.
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From reader reviews:

Dave Thomas:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Singapore Perspectives 2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides.
Try to face the book Singapore Perspectives 2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides as your close
friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside those of course make you
smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence
because you can know everything by the book. So , let's make new experience as well as knowledge with
this book.

Gilbert Kimmel:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Singapore
Perspectives 2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides suitable to you? The book was written by popular
writer in this era. The book untitled Singapore Perspectives 2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Dividesis a
single of several books that everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world.
When you read this publication you will enter the new dimension that you ever know just before. The author
explained their strategy in the simple way, so all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this book.
This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of
the world in this book.

Melissa Fernandez:

Singapore Perspectives 2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides can be one of your basic books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can increase
your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The author
giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Singapore Perspectives
2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides nevertheless doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader
the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Richard Kowalski:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Singapore Perspectives
2012:Singapore Inclusive: Bridging Divides can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are
therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek
activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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