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The Risk Doctor’s Cures for Common Risk Ailments offers tried-and-true cures for risk management
problems at both the organizational and project levels. Written by noted risk management consultant David
Hillson, aka The Risk Doctor, this book gives practical advice based on sound risk management principles
and real-life cases.

Using the medical metaphor, Dr. Hillson prescribes treatment for serious issues that can lead to project or
business failure. These common risk management ailments include risk blindness, risk amnesia, risk
muteness, risk obesity, risk anorexia, risk depression, and risk myopia.

Proper risk management is essential to project and business success but is often misunderstood and
inappropriately applied at all levels of the organization. This book makes the basics comprehensible and the
application of sound risk management workable.

Follow The Risk Doctor’s recommended treatment plan and begin a fast recovery from risk ailments that
have troubled your projects and your business—and look forward to a future filled with the rewards of a
healthy approach to risk management!
About the Author

Dr. David Hillson, PMI Fellow, HonFAPM, FIRM, CMgr, FCMI, FRSA, widely known as The Risk Doctor,
is an international risk management consultant and director of The Risk Doctor Partnership.He has received
many awards for his significant and sustained contributions to the risk discipline, including IRM’s Risk
Personality of the Year and PMI’s David I. Cleland Literature Award.
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From reader reviews:

Walter McBride:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A book The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk
Ailments will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make
you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with
you?

David Pell:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk
Ailments is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

William Mayer:

The ability that you get from The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk Ailments will be the more deep you
searching the information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to know but The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk Ailments giving you joy
feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by anyone
who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this particular The Risk Doctor's Cures for
Common Risk Ailments instantly.

Edward Foland:

The book The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk Ailments will bring that you the new experience of
reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book
to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book The Risk Doctor's Cures for Common Risk Ailments is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quickly
to read the book.
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