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The Tour of the Oisans on the GR54 is a challenging two-week trek around the Ecrins National Park
(southeast of Grenoble) in France, one of the most visually spectacular regions in all the Alps. In the course
of 10-13 days it covers 176km and climbs more than 12,800m to cross a series of challenging cols that
separate deep and enchanting valleys. The scenery is spectacular and ever varied, and with charming villages
and hamlets to visit on the way, the trekker's experience is both rich and rewarding. Accommodation is in
valley hotels or gîtes, or in mountain refuges set in idyllic locations. The route is divided into 10 stages, but
with suggestions for a 13-day itinerary and alternative stages are also described. Full accommodation details
are given along with background information on how to get there, what to take, mountain safety, and notes
on the flora and fauna of the region. All illustrated with colour sketch maps and photographs.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Garcia:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a go walking,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Tour of the Oisans: The
GR54 (Cicerone Guide)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your
time with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have some
other opinion?

Margaret Coleman:

The reason? Because this Tour of the Oisans: The GR54 (Cicerone Guide) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside.
Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who write the book in such remarkable way makes the
content within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for
you because of not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you
a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Michael Joslyn:

The book untitled Tour of the Oisans: The GR54 (Cicerone Guide) contain a lot of information on the idea.
The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so
do not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you
in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone,
or gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide
open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

Jamie Gregory:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Tour of the Oisans: The GR54 (Cicerone Guide) can
be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in
this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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