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In summer 1862, Minnesotans found themselves fighting interconnected wars—the first against the
rebellious Southern states, and the second an internal war against the Sioux. While the Civil War was more
important to the future of the United States, the Dakota War of 1862 proved far more destructive to the
people of Minnesota—both whites and American Indians. It led to U.S. military action against the Sioux,
divided the Dakotas over whether to fight or not, and left hundreds of white settlers dead. In Columns of
Vengeance, historian Paul N. Beck offers a reappraisal of the Punitive Expeditions of 1863 and 1864, the
U.S. Army’s response to the Dakota War of 1862.

Whereas previous accounts have approached the Punitive Expeditions as a military campaign of the Indian
Wars, Beck argues that the expeditions were also an extension of the Civil War. The strategy and tactics
reflected those of the war in the East, and Civil War operations directly affected planning and logistics in the
West. Beck also examines the devastating impact the expeditions had on the various bands and tribes of the
Sioux. Whites viewed the expeditions as punishment—“columns of vengeance” sent against those Dakotas
who had started the war in 1862—yet the majority of the Sioux the army encountered had little or nothing to
do with the earlier uprising in Minnesota.

Rather than relying only on the official records of the commanding officers involved, Beck presents a much
fuller picture of the conflict by consulting the letters, diaries, and personal accounts of the common soldiers
who took part in the expeditions, as well as rare personal narratives from the Dakotas. Drawing on a wealth
of firsthand accounts and linking the Punitive Expeditions of 1863 and 1864 to the overall Civil War
experience, Columns of Vengeance offers fresh insight into an important chapter in the development of U.S.
military operations against the Sioux.
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From reader reviews:

George Carter:

The book Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864 make one feel
enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best
friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading
through a book Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864 for being
your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about
several or all subjects. You may know everything if you like open up and read a book Columns of
Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864. Kinds of book are several. It means
that, science reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this book?

Joni Griffith:

This Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864 book is not really
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is
actually information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person
read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive
Expeditions, 1863-1864 without we understand teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering
and analyzing. Don't become worry Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions,
1863-1864 can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and
the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864 having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will
not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Brooke Jenkins:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know that
little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Numerous books
that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers,
Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864.

Edward Reed:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of
news. In this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.



You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just trying to find the Columns of Vengeance: Soldiers, Sioux, and the Punitive Expeditions, 1863-1864
when you desired it?
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