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Rome and the Friendly King, first published in 1984, offers a functional definition of what is usually called
client kingship – to show what a client king (or ‘friendly king’, to use the Roman term) was in practice.

Each aspect of this complex role is examined over a period of six centuries: the making of a king; exposure
to Roman institutions and individuals; formal recognition as a friendly ruler. Professor Braund shows how
the king’s power related to Roman authority, and to his subjects. The role of Romans in royal wills,
principally as recipients of bequests, is also examined, and it is also shown how some kings were assimilated
completely into Roman society to become senators in their own right.

In conclusion, Professor Braund considers the ways in which both sides benefited from client kingship and,
in doing so, helps to explain the persistent use of such relationships throughout history.
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From reader reviews:

Mary McDonald:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client
Kingship book is readable by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are
arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to
give to you. The writer involving Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client
Kingship content conveys the idea easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not
different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Rome and the
Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client Kingship is not loveable to be your top list
reading book?

Jennifer Ruiz:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the e-book untitled Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The
Character of Client Kingship can be very good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Renee Middleton:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or real their
hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this
period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client Kingship can
make you really feel more interested to read.

Homer Holmes:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By book Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client Kingship we can
have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book.



Simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this
book Rome and the Friendly King (Routledge Revivals): The Character of Client Kingship. You can more
inviting than now.
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