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A beautiful new tale of redemption from the author of Slow Dancing on Price's Pier

Nine years ago, Lauren Matthews prosecuted the case of a lifetime. But her error in judgment sent an
innocent man to prison for a long time. Now Arlen Fieldstone has finally been released, and Lauren has only
one thing on her mind: asking forgiveness. How can she make up for nine years of his life?

To get to Arlen, Lauren must first get through Arlen's best friend, Will Farris. Will hasn't forgotten Lauren
from those days, and he hasn't forgiven her for destroying his best friend's life. He is Arlen's keeper,
protecting him from suspicious neighbors as well as from Lauren.

In the steaming summer streets of Richmond, Virginia, three people's lives collide. Lauren needs
forgiveness. Arlen needs hope. And Will? He needs something too, something that no one can know-
especially not Lauren...
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From reader reviews:

Mark Logan:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled A Promise of
Safekeeping: A Novel? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
using your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other
opinion?

Frederick Rothman:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this A Promise of Safekeeping: A Novel book
as nice and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Sharon Clayton:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer might be A Promise of Safekeeping: A Novel why because the wonderful
cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content
is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this
book.

Eric Beckman:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
when compared with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find e-
book that need more time to be read. A Promise of Safekeeping: A Novel can be your answer as it can be
read by you actually who have those short extra time problems.
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