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The Eighth Edition retains the organization of the Seventh Edition while thoroughly updating it. The first
half of the casebook introduces injunctive relief, damages, restitution, and declaratory relief. The second half
of the book creates opportunities to consider these four remedies in the context of tort and contract actions
for various types of harm. The updates include recent United States Supreme Court cases on such topics as
injunctive relief and punitive damages. New cases in the second half of the book feature such current topics
as injunctions against defamatory statements and public nuisance actions against lead paint manufacturers.
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From reader reviews:

Charles McCreery:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book Equitable Remedies, Restitution and Damages, Cases
and Materials (American Casebook Series). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. As
long as we know about how is important the book Equitable Remedies, Restitution and Damages, Cases and
Materials (American Casebook Series). You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by
the book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can know everything! From your country until
foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you are able to know
that. In this era, we can easily open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Daniel Pitts:

The book Equitable Remedies, Restitution and Damages, Cases and Materials (American Casebook Series)
has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book
was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research prior to write this book. This book
very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this book.

Robert Wolfe:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Equitable Remedies, Restitution and
Damages, Cases and Materials (American Casebook Series) can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you
know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Vickie Duke:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. That Equitable Remedies, Restitution and Damages, Cases and
Materials (American Casebook Series) can give you a lot of friends because by you checking out this one
book you have matter that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can
be one of a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't
realize, by knowing more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have
Equitable Remedies, Restitution and Damages, Cases and Materials (American Casebook Series).
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