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Steven Clemente describes how conservative traditions and artistocratic values were preserved in the
selection and training of German army officers prior to World War I despite changing times and the influx of
many middle-class recruits into the army. He demonstrates how right thinking and service to the King and
the Kaiser were the basis for Prussian officer education in the period from 1860 to 1914.

The history provides considerable detail about German secondary school education, the selection of officers,
the curriculum, and life in the cadet and war schools, the life of a subaltern, and the education of the Prussian
War Academy. The book concludes with an analysis of the attitudes and loyalties of the officers that entered
World War I. Students of European history and military affairs will find this study one that raises a number
of provocative questions about German performance in World War I and in subsequent years.
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From reader reviews:

Madeline Williams:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book For King and Kaiser!: The Making of the
Prussian Army Officer, 1860-1914 (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies,) will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think
that open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they are
often thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Susan Tokarz:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or
something that they don't need do that. You must know how great along with important the book For King
and Kaiser!: The Making of the Prussian Army Officer, 1860-1914 (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies,).
All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social
media.

Frank Keating:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This For King and Kaiser!: The
Making of the Prussian Army Officer, 1860-1914 (Popular Culture Bio-Bibliographies,) can be the respond
to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading
in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Susan Peterson:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. By the
book For King and Kaiser!: The Making of the Prussian Army Officer, 1860-1914 (Popular Culture Bio-
Bibliographies,) we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To be creative person must
choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change
your life by this book For King and Kaiser!: The Making of the Prussian Army Officer, 1860-1914 (Popular
Culture Bio-Bibliographies,). You can more appealing than now.
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