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G. K. Chesterton, the "Prince of Paradox," is at his witty best in this collection of twenty essays and articles
from the turn of the twentieth century. Focusing on "heretics"—those who pride themselves on their
superiority to conservative views—Chesterton appraises prominent figures who fall into that category from
the literary and art worlds. Luminaries such as Rudyard Kipling, George Bernard Shaw, H. G. Wells, and
James McNeill Whistler come under the author's scrutiny, where they meet with equal measures of his
characteristic wisdom and good humor.
In addition to incisive assessments of well-known individuals ("Mr. Rudyard Kipling and Making the World
Small" and "Mr. H. G. Wells and the Giants"), these essays contain observations on the wider world. "On
Sandals and Simplicity," "Science and the Savages," "On Certain Modern Writers and the Institution of the
Family," "On Smart Novelists and the Smart Set," and "Slum Novelists and the Slums" reflect the main
themes of Chesterton's life's work. Heretics roused the ire of some critics for censuring contemporary
philosophies without providing alternatives; the author responded a few years later with a companion
volume, Orthodoxy (also available from Dover Publications). Sardonic, jolly, and generous, both books are
vintage Chesterton.
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From reader reviews:

Jacquelyn Lopez:

The book Heretics (Dover Books on Western Philosophy) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book Heretics (Dover Books on Western
Philosophy)? A few of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many
facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or information
that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Heretics (Dover
Books on Western Philosophy) has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for
you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Randall Briggs:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get
a lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they write
about the data about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the book. One of them is this
Heretics (Dover Books on Western Philosophy).

John Schreiber:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day long to reading a
book. The book Heretics (Dover Books on Western Philosophy) it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough
space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not very costly but this book possesses high quality.

Larisa Nagle:

Precisely why? Because this Heretics (Dover Books on Western Philosophy) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the publication waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside.
Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such wonderful way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give
you a lot of positive aspects than the other book include such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store



hurriedly.
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