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'I was conscious of a most horrible smell of mould, and of a cold kind of face pressed against my own...'

Considered by many to be the most terrifying writer in English, M. R. James was an eminent scholar who
spent his entire adult life in the academic surroundings of Eton and Cambridge. His classic supernatural tales
draw on the terrors of the everyday, in which documents and objects unleash terrible forces, often in closed
rooms and night-time settings where imagination runs riot. Lonely country houses, remote inns, ancient
churches or the manuscript collections of great libraries provide
settings for unbearable menace, from creatures seeking retribution and harm. These stories have lost none of
their power to unsettle and disturb.

This edition presents all of James's published ghost stories, including the unforgettable 'Oh, Whistle and I'll
Come to You, My Lad' and 'Casting the Runes', and an appendix of James's writings on the ghost story.
Darryl Jones's introduction and notes provide a fascinating insight into James's background and his mastery
of the genre he made his own.
ABOUT THE SERIES: For over 100 years Oxford World's Classics has made available the widest range of
literature from around the globe. Each affordable volume reflects Oxford's commitment to scholarship,
providing the most accurate text plus a wealth of other valuable features, including expert introductions by
leading authorities, helpful notes to clarify the text, up-to-date bibliographies for further study, and much
more.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Branson:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) book is readable simply
by you who hate those straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer of
Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) content conveys the idea easily to understand by many
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different in the form of it. So ,
do you even now thinking Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Jerry Brock:

The particular book Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) will bring that you the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find
new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's
Classics) is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web
site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Noah Giles:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Collected
Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in
every aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging just about every
word written in a reserve then become one form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get
previous to. The Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) giving you yet another experience more
than blown away your brain but also giving you useful information for your better life in this era. So now let
us explain to you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you
are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out
spare time activity?

Rosalie Cox:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. By
book Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's Classics) we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be
creative people? To be creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose the best book that suited with
your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book Collected Ghost Stories (Oxford World's
Classics). You can more desirable than now.
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