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As challenges to land use and environmental controls by landowners and the property-rights movement have
become more frequent, the concept of takings -- government action that excessively limits a property-
owner's use of private land -- has become both increasingly familiar to the public, and increasingly
problematic for planners, local officials, and anyone involved with making day-to-day decisions about land
use. A vast and diverse body of case law has come into existence over the past several decades, and the
controversy generated by recent legal decisions has resulted in a significant level of ideological bias in much
of what has been written on the topic.This volume is an objective and authoritative examination that
considers all aspects of the takings issue. It is a much-needed guide and overview that introduces and
explains issues surrounding regulatory takings on the local, state, and federal level for anyone involved with
private land and government limitation of its permissible use. The authors describe where the law is now,
predict where it might go in the future, and review conflict-reducing solutions to a variety of situations. They
condense an immense amount of information into a clear and accesible format, making the book equally
valuable for lawyers and non-lawyers alike.The Takings Issue addresses procedural hurdles involved in
getting a takings issue heard by a court, examines what does and does not constitute a taking, and considers
the remedies available to landowners involved in takings actions. It treats concerns such as zoning,
dedications and exactions, subdivision platting, and other local issues in some detail, and also considers state
and federal issuesinvolving industrial site approval, endangered species and wetlands protection, restrictions
on access to resources on federal lands, and other topics.The book is an essential reference for planners, land
use lawyers, developers, and students of planning and law, as well as for policymakers and citizens involved
with takings issues.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Feaster:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book The Takings Issue: Constitutional Limits On Land Use
Control And Environmental Regulation. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Providing
we know about how is important any book The Takings Issue: Constitutional Limits On Land Use Control
And Environmental Regulation. You can add information and of course you can around the world by way of
a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you will end up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we
can open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel
bored stiff to go to the library. Let's study.

Sergio Kelley:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare time to
perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time? What did you do? All
people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question due to the fact just their can do in
which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on jardín
de infancia until university need this kind of The Takings Issue: Constitutional Limits On Land Use Control
And Environmental Regulation to read.

Jesus Curry:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
will certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Takings Issue: Constitutional
Limits On Land Use Control And Environmental Regulation is our recommendation to cause you to keep up
with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Sunny Lopez:

The book untitled The Takings Issue: Constitutional Limits On Land Use Control And Environmental
Regulation contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique.
The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the item.
The book was compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new age of literary works. You
can easily read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the
book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their
official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.
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