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John Urry has been discussing and writing on these and similar questions for the past fifteen years. In
Consuming Places, he gathers together his most significant contributions. Urry begins with an extensive
review of the connections between society, time and space. The concept of 'society', the nature of 'locality',
the significance of 'economic restructuring', and the concept of the 'rural', are examined in relationship to
place. The book then considers how places have been transformed by the development of service
occupations and industries. Concepts of the service class and post-industrialism are theoretically and
empirically discussed. Attention is then devoted to the ways in which places are consumed. Particular
attention is devoted to the visual character of such consumption and its implications for place and people.
The implications for nature and the environment are also explored in depth. The changing nature of
consumption, and the tensions between commodification and collective enthusiasms, are explored in the
context of the changing ways in which the countryside is consumed.
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From reader reviews:

James Miguel:

This Consuming Places (International Library of Sociology) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have
it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is usually information inside
this reserve incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you
will get. That Consuming Places (International Library of Sociology) without we know teach the one who
examining it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't become worry Consuming Places
(International Library of Sociology) can bring once you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This
Consuming Places (International Library of Sociology) having good arrangement in word along with layout,
so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Elaine Roberts:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
habit give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind
of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want
experience happy read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Consuming
Places (International Library of Sociology) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Stephanie Hopkins:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or their
very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic in the
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The
first thing you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test look for book, may
be the e-book untitled Consuming Places (International Library of Sociology) can be excellent book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

Robert Hill:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Consuming Places (International
Library of Sociology), you can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it?
What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on
its called reading friends.
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