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"Professor Charnes's book drives clarity into applied Monte Carlo analysis using examples and tools relevant
to real-world finance. The book will prove useful for analysts of all levels and as a supplement to academic
courses in multiple disciplines."
-Mark Odermann, Senior Financial Analyst, Microsoft

"Think you really know financial modeling? This is a must-have for power Excel users. Professor Charnes
shows how to make more realistic models that result in fewer surprises. Every analyst needs this credibility
booster."
-James Franklin, CEO, Decisioneering, Inc.

"This book packs a first-year MBA's worth of financial and business modeling education into a few dozen
easy-to-understand examples. Crystal Ball software does the housekeeping, so readers can concentrate on the
business decision. A careful reader who works the examples on a computer will master the best general-
purpose technology available for working with uncertainty."
-Aaron Brown, Executive Director, Morgan Stanley, author of The Poker Face of Wall Street

"Using Crystal Ball and Excel, John Charnes takes you step by step, demonstrating a conceptual framework
that turns static Excel data and financial models into true risk models. I am astonished by the clarity of the
text and the hands-on, step-by-step examples using Crystal Ball and Excel; Professor Charnes is a masterful
teacher, and this is an absolute gem of a book for the new generation of analyst."
-Brian Watt, Chief Operating Officer, GECC, Inc.

"Financial Modeling with Crystal Ball and Excel is a comprehensive, well-written guide to one of the most
useful analysis tools available to professional risk managers and quantitative analysts. This is a must-have
book for anyone using Crystal Ball, and anyone wanting an overview of basic risk management concepts."
-Paul Dietz, Manager, Quantitative Analysis, Westar Energy

"John Charnes presents an insightful exploration of techniques for analysis and understanding of risk and
uncertainty in business cases. By application of real options theory and Monte Carlo simulation to planning,
doors are opened to analysis of what used to be impossible, such as modeling the value today of future
project choices."
-Bruce Wallace, Nortel
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From reader reviews:

Barry Phelan:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider if
those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take Financial Modeling with Crystal Ball and Excel (Wiley Finance) as
the daily resource information.

Mary Logsdon:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic in the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to test look for
book, may be the reserve untitled Financial Modeling with Crystal Ball and Excel (Wiley Finance) can be
excellent book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Valerie Bell:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to share.
You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you
is Financial Modeling with Crystal Ball and Excel (Wiley Finance) this reserve consist a lot of the
information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how does the world
has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer
made some analysis when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.

Robert Dunham:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This Financial Modeling with Crystal Ball and Excel (Wiley
Finance) can give you a lot of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have point that
they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you
to get success. This e-book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more
than some other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let us have Financial Modeling with
Crystal Ball and Excel (Wiley Finance).
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