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If a major event such as a terrorist attack, 7.2 earthquake, tsunami, or hacker attack were to disrupt business
operations, would your organization be prepared to respond to the financial, political, and social impacts? In
order for your company to be resilient, it must be ready to respond and recover quickly from the impact of
such events. Business continuity is the discipline that can help your organization become truly resilient.

Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach explains how to deploy project
management, risk management, business continuity, and business preparedness methods in a manner that
will ensure organizational resiliency. With an emphasis on building business preparedness plans, it covers
the fundamental principles of project management, risk management, business continuity, and business
preparedness.

Upon reading this book, you will learn how to apply project management to institute business continuity
governance and to build and maintain business preparedness plans. You will also learn what’s required to
conduct an effective business impact analysis.

Detailing a proven plan for achieving business continuity and business preparedness, the book includes
numerous diagrams, checklists, and tools to help you determine exactly what you must do to prepare for a
serious event. It also explains how to test your continuity plans and evaluate preparedness processes to
ensure your organization will be truly prepared to withstand or recover from the next emergency, disaster, or
catastrophic event to affect your organization.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Clark:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach book is
readable through you who hate the straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for
enjoyable studying experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you.
The writer regarding Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach content conveys
thinking easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it
just different such as it. So , do you even now thinking Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management
Approach is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Melanie Fox:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Business Continuity Planning: A Project
Management Approach can be the reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of
date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Jeannie Brenner:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be
rare? Why so many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but novel and Business Continuity Planning: A Project
Management Approach or maybe others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the
good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or students
especially. Those publications are helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional case, beside
science e-book, any other book likes Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach to
make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Donnie Ned:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach we can get more
advantage. Don't one to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book
Business Continuity Planning: A Project Management Approach. You can more attractive than now.
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