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No program of the federal government has elicited so many calls for reform—and none has resisted reform
efforts so consistently—as the income tax. In this book, John Witte provides the most detailed, clearly stated,
accurate, and up-to-date exposition of the history of the federal income tax, while offering an acute analysis
of the political factors that have shaped it over more than a century. This work is essential source material for
all policy makers and policy analysts, and a lucid and comprehensive survey for students in public policy,
public administration, budget and tax policy, political economy, and contemporary political theory. In short,
Witte explains in graphic detail why the income tax remains in virtual chaos, and just what the prospects are
of future reform.
    Witte’s analysis is based in the context of incremental/pluralist policy-making theory. He begins by
outlining and analyzing incremental theory and income tax policy, and then surveys past and present theories
in income taxation. The broad center of the book consists of a detailed legislative and political history of the
development of the income tax from the Civil War through the Reagan policies of the 1980s. Witte then
offers an analysis of the growth, distribution, and politics of approximately one hundred tax expenditure
provisions, and he concludes with an appraisal of recorded public opinions on income tax issues between
1948 and 1979.
    Witte’s book, original in concept and boldly stated, will be essential reading not only for tax scholars,
students, and professionals, but for all who are concerned with the form of American democracy and the
political life of the nation.
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From reader reviews:

David Barthel:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Federal Income Tax will make you to possibly
be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think
which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be thought
like that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Willie McCorkle:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will
make you to definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for your requirements is Federal Income Tax this publication consist a lot of the information
from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Paul Lopez:

Beside that Federal Income Tax in your phone, it could give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from your oven so don't
be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Federal Income
Tax because this book offers for you readable information. Do you at times have book but you do not get
what it's all about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable set up here
cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book
as well as read it from at this point!

Louise Denison:

This Federal Income Tax is brand new way for you who has interest to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Federal Income Tax can be the light food for
you because the information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books produce itself
in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in
guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
reserve especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the
item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and knowledge.
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